City of Wauwatosa

Purchasing Department

Bid for: Stone, Sand and Grave! for 2024 Construction and Repair Season (1/2/24 thru 12/31/24)
Bids Received: October 24, 2023 at 11:01 AM

Official Notice posted to Daily Reporter on 10/10/23

ltem 1 #1, Hem1 ltem 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 item 6

2,&3 Recycled 3/8" Lime- Traffic Mason Crushed Road  Torpedo

Stane Aggregate Stone Chips Bond Sand Gravel Sand TERMS PCARD
Lannon Stone Products $ 18.00 5 1500 § 2000 S 15.00 no bid no bid S 15.00 Net Yes
Lannon, WI
Payne and Dolan Inc. S 2170 no bid S 23.70 5 1525 S 35.00 no bid no hid Net Yes
Waukesha, Wi
Johnson Sand & Gravel* no bid no bid no bid nobid  $ 1975 $ 1350 $ 1450  10%/20  Yes
New Berlin, WI
Halquist Stone Company no bid no bid no bid no hid no bid s 17.75 $ 19.55 Net No
Sussex, WI
Notes:

Prices are per ton
Minimum truckioad delivery: 20 -22 Tons per truckload
*Johnson's Sand & Gravel is offering a 10% discount on quoted items if paid within 20 days



OFFICIAL BID FORM FOR CRUSHED STONE, SAND AND GRAVEL,

To the City of Wauwatosa
Wauwatosa, Wisconsin

in accordance with your Official Notice and Specifications both dated October 10, 2023 I/we, the
undersigned hereby propose to furnish the following stone, and/or sand, and/or gravel, delivered to your
job or storage site in Wauwatosa, Wisconsin during the 2024 construction and repair season beginning
January 2, 2024, and ending December 31, 2024,

Price Per Ton Delivered

ITEM 1:

Crushed limestone, No. 1, 2 and 3 and screenings: $ no bid per ton
Recycled aggregate: $ no bid per ton
ITEM 2:

3/8” Limestone Chips: $ no bid per ton
ITEM 3:

Crushed limestone, traffic bond: $ no bid per ton
ITEM 4: '

Washed mason sand: b3 19.75 per ton
ITEM 5:

Crushed road gravel, Type B, State Specification: $ 13.50 per ton
ITEM 6:

Washed torpedo sand for summmer conerete work (or

winter ice control) $ 14,50 per ton
Deliveries will be made within two hours notice.

The above delivered prices are based on furnishing material in minimum truckloads as follows:

LEIMESTONE : n/a tons per load.
SAND: 20 tons per load.
ROAD GRAVEL: 20 tons per load.

TERMS (Cash discount): _10 percent for payment of invoice within 20 days, Peard accepted? Y _x N

NAME OF COMPANY Johnson Sand & Gravel Inc,

ADDRESS __W220 56700 Crowbar Drive

CITY __ Muskego STATE WI ZIP CODE__ 53150

PHONE __262/679-4400 FAX 262/679-5565 DATE__10/12/2023

SIGNATURE: lllﬁlM MJ EMAL, amanda@johmsopsandandgravel.net
PLEASE TYPE OR PRINT NWME & TITLE __ Amanda Pfeifer, Estimator




OFFICIAL BID FORM FOR CRUSHED STONE, SAND AND GRAVEL

To the City of Wauwatosa
Wauwatosa, Wisconsin

In accordance with your Official Notice and Specifications both dated October 10, 2023 T/we, the
undersigned hereby propose to furnish the following stone, and/or sand, and/or gravel, delivered to your
Job or storage site in Wauwatosa, Wisconsin during the 2024 construction and repair season beginning
January 2, 2024, and ending December 31, 2024.

Price Per Ton Delivered

ITEM 1:

Crushed limestone, No. 1, 2 and 3 and screenings: $ 21.7¢ per ton
Recycled aggregate: $ NA per ton
ITEM 2:

3/8” Limestone Chips: $ 23.70 pet ton
ITEM 3;

Crushed limestone, traffic bond: $ 15.25 per ton
ITEM 4:

Washed mason sand: $ 35.00 per ton
ITEM 5:

Crushed road gravel, Type B, State Specification: $ NA per ton
ITEM 6:

Washed torpedo sand for summer concrete work (or

winter ice control) $ NA per ton
Deliveries will be made within 24 hours nofice.

The above delivered prices are based on furnishing material in minimum truckloads as follows:

LIMESTONE : 20 tons per load.
SAND: 20 tons per load.
ROAD GRAVEL: 20 tons per load.

TERMS (Cash discount): ___ percent for payment of invoice within 20 days. Pcard accepted‘@X N

NAME OF COMPANY Payne and Dolan (Waukesha Lime and Stone)

ADDRESS N3 W23650 Badinger Road

CITY Waulkesha STATE WI ZIP CODE
PHONE 262-524-1700 FAX 202-524-1845 DATE 10/23/23
SIGNATURE: %/5& /0 S&u{}% EMAIL__ psovey@walbecgroup.com

PLEASE TYPE OR PRINT NAME & TITLE __ Parker Sovey - Construction Materials Sales Manager



OFFICIAL BID FORM FOR CRUSHED STONE, SAND AND GRAVEL

To the City of Wauwatosa
Wauwatosa, Wisconsin

In accordance with your Official Notice and Specifications both dated October 10, 2023 I/we, the
undersigned hereby propose to furnish the following stone, and/or sand, and/or gravel, delivered to your
job or storage site in Wauwatosa, Wisconsin during the 2024 construction and repair season beginning
January 2, 2024, and ending December 31, 2024. ‘

Price Per Ton Delivered

ITEM 1:
Crushed limestone, No. 1, 2 and 3 and screenings: $ 18.00 per ton
Recycled aggregate: $ 15.00 per ton

ITEM 2;
3/8” Limestone Chips: $ 2000 per ton

ITEM 3:
Crushed limestone, traffic bond: $ 15.00 per ton

ITEM 4:

Washed mason sand: $ N/A

per ton

ITEM 5:

Crushed road gravel, Type B, State Specification: $ N/A

per ton

ITEM 6:
Washed torpedo sand for summer concrete work {or
winter ice control) $ 15.00 per ton

Deliveries will be made within 24 hours notice.

The above delivered prices are based on furnishing material in minimum truckloads as follows:

LIMESTONE : 21 tons per load.
21

SAND: tons per load.

ROAD GRAVEL: N/a tons per load.,

TERMS (Cash discount): _0_percent for payment of invoice within 20 days. Pcard accepted?@_

NAME OF COMPANY Lannon Stone Products

N52W23096 Lisbon Rd

ADDRESS

crry _ Sussex sTaTE W1 ziPcopE 008

PLONE 262-251-1520 ey 7 FAX 262-251-6710 DATE 10/23/2023

SIGNATURE: W’; EMALL uotes@lannonstone.net
T C

PLEASE TYPE OR PRINT NAME & TITLE F2ul Minneti - Director of Sales Operations




To the City of Wauwatosa
Wauwatosa, Wisconsin

In accordance with your Official Notice and Specifications both dated October 10, 2023 I/we, the
undersigned hereby propose to furnish the following stone, and/or sand, and/or gravel, delivered to your
job or storage site in Wauwatosa, Wisconsin during the 2024 construction and repair season beginning
January 2, 2024, and ending December 31, 2024.

Price Per Ton Delivered

ITEM 1:
Crushed limestone, No. 1, 2 and 3 and screenings:
Recycled aggregate:

per ton
pet ton

ITEM 2: .
3/8” Limestone Chips: $ Ny hh“) per ton

ITEM 3:
Crushed limestone, traffic bond: $ Ne Tin per ton

ITEM 4:
Washed mason sand: $ N "B perton

ITEM 5:
Crushed road gravel, Type B, State Specification: $ i 1 S— __perton

ITEM 6:
Washed torpedo sand for summer concrete work (or - | o<

winter ice control) s 1K1, > per ton

Deliveries will be made within J "'f hours notice,

The above delivered prices are based on furnishing material in minimum truckloads as follows:

LIMESTONE : N tons per load.
SAND: 2 | tons per load.
ROAD GRAVEL: 2 | tons pet load.

TERMS (Cash discount): _0_ percent for payment of invoice within 20 days. Pcard accepted? Y___ NX
NAME OF COMPANY __ W di.GguisT ST BE Coaddert, e
ADDRESS __ N SN (W 23%L3 L vherd Ry

CITY Qs SER / STATE _{J\ ZIPCODE S 3 0F87-03¢8
PHONRZ e = 'i/é’ci_ 5,@:-{ ¢ FAX 20 2~ 2~ L% P DATE ((— >3~23
SIGN URI‘. ,} EMAIL -—{-uu«..p\ L\.n..(t.' LA s‘*‘?“\ne- Ca N

PLEASE TYPE

{PRINT NAML, & TITLE ,_‘_*.,:'_LLQ______



